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PRODUCER PRICE INDEX (2010=100) BY SECTOR (MSIC 2008)

The Producer Price Index (PPI) local production edged up 11.3 per cent year-on-year in August 2021 as
compared to negative 2.8 per cent recorded in the same month of the preceding year. The PPI local
production  recorded  an  increase  for  the  straight  seven  months.  The  increase  in  August  2021  was
attributed mainly by the Mining index that surged 51.8 per cent (August 2020: -33.7%), followed by the
indexes of Agriculture, forestry & fishing and Manufacturing with year-on-year growth of 27.6 per cent and
7.1 per cent respectively. The utility index also registered an increase of 0.4 per cent for Electricity & gas
supply index, while, Water supply index recorded a drop of 0.4 per cent.

A month-on-month comparison showed that the PPI local production rose 0.6 per cent in August 2021, the
same growth recorded in July 2021. The index of Agriculture, forestry & fishing moved up 2.8 per cent as
opposed to 2.2 per cent recorded in the previous month. The increase of 0.6 percentage points was due to
higher prices of Chicken (5.2%) and Fresh Fruit Bunches (3.6%). Nevertheless, the Mining index registered
a decline of negative 0.8 per cent (July 2021: 3.9%) attributed by the fall in Crude Oil prices (-2.9%)
despite continuous rise in Natural Gas commodity prices (10.1%). On the other hand, the Manufacturing
index recorded an increase of 0.4 per cent contributed by an increase in the prices of refined petroleum
commodity (2.0%), commodity based on vegetable and animal oils and fats (0.5%) and products related to
electronic components and boards (0.4%). Index of Electricity & gas supply also increased 0.1 per cent
while Water supply index decreased by negative 0.2 per cent.

Table 1 : Producer Price Index (2010=100) Local Production by Sector (MSIC 2008), Malaysia

PRODUCER PRICE INDEX BY STAGE OF PROCESSING

In August 2021, the index of Crude materials for further processing increased 30.9 per cent as opposed to
negative 8.7 per cent recorded in the same month of the previous year. The rise was contributed by
indexes of Non-food materials and Foodstuffs & feedstuffs which moved up 37.5 per cent and 4.4 per cent.
Similarly, the index of Intermediate materials, supplies & components also increased 11.2 per cent (August
2020: -2.0%) supported mainly by Processed fuel & lubricants (20.0%) and Materials & components for
manufacturing (12.7%) indexes. However, the index of Finished goods registered a decrease of 1.3 per
cent.

The same trend can be seen in  terms of  month-on-month comparison where the indexes of  Crude
materials for further processing and Intermediate materials, supplies & components increased 0.6 per cent
and 1.0 per cent respectively. Meanwhile, the index of Finished goods decreased 0.2 per cent.

Table 2 : Producer Price Index (2010=100) Local Production by Stage of Processing



 

 



The full publication of the Producer Price Index Malaysia, August 2021 can be downloaded from  eStatistik
portal.
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